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Chapter 81: Shen Yun Apologizes

Even though that was the case, Zhao Gang was still afraid.

To Zhao Gang, it was undoubtedly a huge risk to touch someone whose

status was far higher than his.

“If we are discovered, then… we would be dead meat…” Zhao Gang’s

face was filled with fear.

Shen Tian snorted and said, “If you want to be a big shot, how can you not

take risks? If you want to live like this for the rest of your life, you can

refuse.”

After saying that, Shen Tian turned his head to the side and didn’t say

anything else.

Zhao Gang sat there for a long time without saying anything.

After a long time, Zhao Gang looked at Shen Tian and said, “Let me think

about it. I’ll give you my decision tomorrow.”

“Okay.” Shen Tian nodded.

Then, he said with a smile, “There aren’t many opportunities in life. You
have to consider it carefully.”

“I know.” Zhao Gang nodded and then left the bar.

Shen Tian sneered.

He believed that Zhao Gang would definitely agree, because a greedy
person like Zhao Gang definitely wouldn’t be able to resist the temptation.



The greed of human nature was the biggest loophole to be exploited.

Shen Tian’s idea was very simple. If he found someone to kidnap Yan

Ruoxue, then the Yan family would be furious and would definitely vent

their anger on Qin Yu.

Even if Qin Yu was lucky enough to obtain the Yan family’s forgiveness,
Yan Ruoxue would definitely be brought back to Jingdu.

At that time, wouldn’t Qin Yu be a piece of cake for him to deal with?

Even if the Yan family really found out, the Shen family could still deny

it and blame everything on Zhao Gang.

“I’m really a genius!” Shen Tian couldn’t help but laugh smugly.

…

The next day, Qin Yu rushed back to Jiangcheng from the provincial

capital.

This time, his harvest was quite bountiful. The herbs given by Wei Jiang

and the one given by Zheng Mingshuo were enough for Qin Yu to
advance to the Foundation Establishment Stage.

“I wonder how long it will take for me to advance to the Foundation
Establishment Stage from the Qi Refining Stage,” Qin Yu thought to

himself.

Therefore, before that, Qin Yu had to make arrangements in advance.

He put away the herbs for the time being and then planned to pick the
prime spot.

“It would be great if I could stay in Shen Tian’s villa,” Qin Yu thought to
himself.



The spiritual energy environment there was the best Qin Yu had ever
seen. Unfortunately, the relationship between the two made it impossible

for Qin Yu to stay there.

At this moment, a Land Rover suddenly drove in from outside the door.

The car stopped in front of Qin Yu, and then a man in a black suit walked
out.

“Is Mr. Qin at home?” The man in the black suit stood at the door and

asked.

Qin Yu frowned. He walked forward and said, “I am. What do you

want?”

The man in the black suit said politely, “Mr. Wu wants to invite you to

dinner tonight. I wonder if you are free.”

“Mr. Wu? Uncle Wu?” Qin Yu suddenly remembered him.

Since the last incident, the two of them hadn’t crossed any paths.

“Could it be that he’s here for the Shen Family?” Qin Yu thought to

himself.

Uncle Wu and the Yan family had a good relationship, plus Qin Yu had

already snubbed him last time.

Therefore, after thinking about it, Qin Yu decided to agree to it for Yan

Ruoxue’s sake.

“Okay, tell me the time and place,” Qin Yu said.

The man in the black suit hurriedly said, “It’s tonight at eight o’clock, at
the Xiaojiang Fishing Village.”



“Okay, I’ll definitely be there on time,” Qin Yu said.

After the man in the black suit left, Yao Qing walked forward quickly.

“Mr. Qin, Mr. Wu and Shen Yun are good friends. I’m afraid it’s a trap,”
Yao Qing warned him.

Qin Yu smiled slightly and said, “It’s okay. I believe they won’t be able to
do anything to me.”

Yao Qing wanted to say something, but was stopped by Qin Yu with a

wave of his hand.

On the other hand, Zhao Gang and Su Yan were lying on the bed. Zhao
Gang was smoking non-stop with a frown.

“Honey, what’s wrong?” Su Yan laid on Zhao Gang’s body and said in a

sweet voice.

Looking at Su Yan, Zhao Gang felt an inexplicable sense of annoyance.

He was feeling more and more regretful that he married such a shallow
and vain woman.

“No, I can’t accept the status quo!” Zhao Gang made up his mind and

threw the cigarette butt in his hand on the ground. Then, he picked up

his phone and ran to the balcony.

He made a call to Shen Tian.

After the call was connected, Zhao Gang said on the phone, “Mr. Shen, I
agree.”

On the other end, Shen Tian burst into laughter and said, “I knew you

would make the right choice.”



Zhao Gang said in a sullen voice, “Mr. Shen, I have a few conditions.”

“Go ahead,” Shen Tian agreed.

“If we succeed, the Zhao family will have a deep business cooperation

with the Shen family,” Zhao Gang said.

Shen Tian smiled nonchalantly and said, “Of course, there’s no problem
with that. Don’t worry, My Shen family definitely won’t mistreat you.”

Zhao Gang continued, “If the matter is exposed, you have to prepare 100
million in cash for me and guarantee my safe departure.”

“Hahaha, no problem!” Shen Tian laughed out loud. “But no one can find
out that this has anything to do with the Shen family. Otherwise, you
know the consequences.”

“Okay.” Zhao Gang nodded and agreed.

After hanging up the phone, Shen Tian couldn’t help but sneer.

If this matter got exposed, Zhao Gang wanted him to give me cash? He

might as well wait for his death! He would have disassociated himself

long before that!

“Just wait and see. There will be drama.” Shen Tian smiled smugly.

…

At night, Qin Yu prepared a simple gift and rushed to Xiaojiang Fishing

Village.

There was already some waiting at the entrance of Xiaojiang Fishing
Village. As soon as he saw Qin Yu, he quickly walked forward and said,
“Mr. Wu has been waiting for you for a long time.”



Qin Yu nodded. He followed behind the receptionist and entered the

private room.

“This is the place. Mr. Qin, please come in,” the receptionist said
politely.

Qin Yu glanced around and made sure that there was no danger before
pushing open the door and entering.

The moment the door opened, Qin Yu’s expression turned cold.

“As expected,” Qin Yu said coldly.

Then, Qin Yu looked at Uncle Wu and said, “Uncle Wu, if you want to

have dinner with me, I’m very happy. If you have ulterior motives, then
I’m sorry, but I won’t accompany you.”

After saying this, Qin Yu turned around to leave.

Uncle Wu hurriedly shouted, “Qin Yu, don’t be so impatient. Just do this
for my sake, okay?”

Qin Yu stopped and looked at Uncle Wu. He said with a nonchalant smile,
“Uncle Wu, have you forgotten what you said? You said that the Shen

family won’t let me off the hook.What do you mean by doing this now?”

Uncle Wu couldn’t help but blush. How could he have expected that the

Shen family wasn’t a match for Qin Yu?

“Qin Yu, there are no eternal enemies, only eternal interests,” Shen Yun
finally said.

He stood up and said, “I was wrong for what happened before. This time,
I invited Uncle Wu to set up this meeting to apologize to you!”



“Apologize to me?” Qin Yu scratched his ears, as if he couldn’t believe
what he was hearing.

Uncle Wu waved his hand and said, “Have a seat. Have a seat..”

Chapter 82: Yan Ruoxue Gets Kidnapped

Qin Yu looked at Uncle Wu for a while and finally sat down.

He really wanted to hear what Shen Yun would say.

“Qin Yu, I really didn’t expect you to grow so fast,” Uncle Wu said

politely.

Shen Yun also lamented, “Young people nowadays really surprise us.”

Qin Yu glanced at Shen Yun and said, “If you have something to say, just
say it. I’m very busy. I have something to do later.”

Uncle Wu frowned slightly. It was obvious that he wasn’t satisfied with

Qin Yu’s attitude.

However, in this kind of situation, he couldn’t say anything. He looked at
Shen Yun.

Shen Yun coughed and said, “Qin Yu, from the beginning to the end, our
Shen family didn’t do anything wrong.”

“You broke my son’s arm, and I didn’t take any drastic actions. So if you
think about it carefully, we don’t seem to have any unresolvable enmity,
right?” Shen Yun said with a smile.

Qin Yu looked at Shen Yun and said with an insincere smile, “Director
Shen, is this what you mean? If I didn’t have the Soul Nourishment Pill,
would you sit down and talk with me calmly now?”



Shen Yun laughed and said, “There is no absolute in everything.”

Qin Yu sneered.

He had long promised Yan Ruoxue that even if Shen Yun begged him,
he would never give him a way out.

A person like Shen Yun would definitely backstab him once he got the
chance.

Uncle Wu coughed and said, “There has to be an end to this matter.
Today, everyone is sitting together for my sake. How about this?”

He paused for a moment, then pointed at Shen Yun and said, “Isn’t it
beneficial for your families to work together to become more powerful
and profit together?”

“Yes, yes, yes, I also have the same intention! With the strength of our

Shen family and the Soul Nourishment Pill in your hands, we will
definitely be able to become more powerful!” Shen Yun hurriedly raised
his wine cup and said.

However, Qin Yu didn’t have the intention to toast him. Instead, he kept
sneering.

“Shen Yun, what qualifications do you have to cooperate with me now?”
Qin Yu asked coldly.

Shen Yun’s expression instantly changed. He never thought that Qin Yu
would say it so straightforwardly! He also never thought that Qin Yu
would be so arrogant!

“Shen Yun, to tell you the truth, I can cure your son’s arm. Moreover,
when we first met, I thought of treating your son’s arm,” Qin Yu said

coldly.



“But unfortunately, your arrogant attitude made me change my mind.”

“Now, I don’t plan to have anything to do with you anymore.”

After hearing Qin Yu’s words, Shen Yun hurriedly said with a bit of

urgency, “Qin Yu, is what you said true? Can you really fix my son’s

arm?”

“Absolutely true,” Qin Yu said coldly.

Shen Yun immediately became a bit excited.

His Adam’s apple bobbed and he said with some pleading, “Qin Yu, if
you can cure my son’s arm, I’m willing to agree to anything!”

“I can give you 10% … No, 30% of the company’s shares!” Shen Yun
said anxiously.

Qin Yu shook his head and said, “I said that I absolutely won’t cooperate
with you.”

Shen Yun gritted his teeth and said, “Let’s put aside the matter of
cooperation for now. I beg you to cure my son’s arm!”

After saying that, Shen Yun actually stood up and knelt down to Qin Yu.

This surprised Qin Yu extremely.

He never expected that a person like Shen Yun would stoop to kneel
down to him!

“He really loves his son dearly.” Qin Yu couldn’t help but lament inside.

He pondered over it for a moment and said, “I can cure your son’s arm,
but… it’s impossible to cooperate unless you’re willing to work for me.”



Shen Yun gritted his teeth and said, “Okay, I promise you!”

Qin Yu nodded slightly and said, “Let your son come to my house

tomorrow.”

“Of course! Of course!” Shen Yun stood up and thanked him repeatedly.

Uncle Wu, who was beside him, fell into deep thought.

At this moment, his impression of Qin Yu suddenly changed.

He originally thought that Qin Yu was just a good-for-nothing. However,
through tonight’s dinner, Uncle Wu realized that this Qin Yu had a sense

of decency and was extremely ambitious.

Facing the olive branch that the Shen family offered, he wasn’t the
slightest bit tempted. Instead, he chose to annex the other party.

It might be too cruel for ordinary people, but in the business world, it was
a necessary evil.

When done by a young man who had just entered the business world, this
indeed surprised Uncle Wu.

“Then let’s hope everything goes smoothly!” Uncle Wu raised his wine

glass and said with a smile.

This time, Qin Yu picked up his wine glass.

Just as he was about to clink glasses, Qin Yu’s phone suddenly rang.

He picked up his cell phone and saw that the caller was actually Yan
Ruoxue’s secretary.

Qin Yu couldn’t help but frown. He put down his wine glass and said

politely, “Sorry, I have to take this call first.”



As soon as the call was connected, Qin Yu heard the secretary on the

other end say anxiously, “Qin Yu, Miss Yan has been kidnapped!”

“What?!” Qin Yu’s expression suddenly changed drastically. A
murderous aura instantly filled the entire room!

“What’s going on?” Qin Yu hurriedly asked.

The secretary on the other end hurriedly recounted what had happened
to Qin Yu.

“I’ve already informed all personnel in Jiangcheng, but we still haven’t
found any trace of her,” the secretary said with some distress.

Qin Yu’s expression was extremely cold. Anger instantly overcame him!

To Qin Yu, Yan Ruoxue was the light of his life.

Qin Yu was willing to give up everything else, but he would never allow
anyone to hurt Yan Ruoxue

He took a deep breath and said, “I’ll go over right now.”

“Qin Yu, what happened?” Uncle Wu asked after Qin Yu hung up the

phone.

Qin Yu didn’t have time to explain to them, so he looked at Uncle Wu

and said, “Lend me your car.”

“Huh? If there’s an emergency, I’ll get someone to send you there,”
Uncle Wu said.

“No need.” Qin Yu didn’t bother to explain. He picked up the keys on the
table and turned to leave.



On the way, Qin Yu frantically rushed to the Yan family’s manor. He
stepped on the accelerator so forcefully that it was almost broken, and he

drove through countless traffic lights.

The passers-by cursed at Qin Yu and treated him as a drag racer.

After Qin Yu left, Uncle Wu received a phone call and got the news.

After he hung up the phone, Uncle Wu’s expression was extremely ugly.

“What happened?” Shen Yun asked in confusion.

Uncle Wu took a deep breath and said in a sullen voice, “Someone

kidnapped Yan Ruoxue.”

“What?!” Hearing this, Shen Yun suddenly stood up!

“Who… who is so bold? Do they want to get themselves killed?” Shen
Yun widened his eyes and said in shock.

UncleWu didn’t say anything. He just sighed and said, “I’m afraid things

are going to change in Jiangcheng..”

Chapter 83: The Angry Qin Yu

In Jiangcheng, this night was full of chaos

After this incident happened, Uncle Wu wasn’t in the mood to eat. He
said goodbye to Shen Yun and quickly left Jiangcheng.

Shen Yun also returned home resentfully.

When he got home, Shen Tian was sitting on the sofa playing games and

eating snacks. He looked quite comfortable.

“Dad, what’s wrong?” Shen Tian asked casually.



Shen Yun glanced at him and whispered, “Yan Ruoxue was kidnapped. I
really don’t know who did it…”

Hearing this, Shen Tian couldn’t help but laugh.

He said proudly, “Dad, you can’t imagine it, right? I did this!”

Shen Yun frowned slightly and said, “You can’t joke about this kind of

thing.”

Shen Tian hurriedly explained, “I really did it! Didn’t I tell you? We

have to teach her a lesson!”

Shen Yun, who was sitting on the sofa, suddenly stood up.

He stared at Shen Tian and said in a trembling voice, “It… It really was

you?”

“Why would I lie? It’s absolutely true!” Shen Tian patted his chest and

said.

Hearing this, Shen Yun raised his hand and slapped Shen Tian’s face!

“Are you crazy! Don’t you know who Yan Ruoxue is?!” Shen Yun, his
body trembling, glared at Shen Tian.

Shen Tian covered his face and said with some anger, “Dad, you… you

actually hit me? You’ve never hit me before!”

“I want to kill you!” Shen Yun gritted his teeth.

“This matter originally had a turn for the better, but you just had to cause

trouble! Do you know the consequences of hurting Yan Ruoxue?!” Shen
Yun said angrily.



Shen Tian didn’t care. He snorted and said, “Dad, what are you worried

about? I’ve already found a scapegoat. My plan is foolproof!”

Then, Shen Tian told Shen Yun what happened.

After Shen Yun heard it, he broke out in a cold sweat.

This was called foolproof? This was simply full of loopholes!

“You are really an idiot!” Shen Yun said through gritted teeth.

He kept pacing around the room. Panic and fear overwhelmed him.

This was also the first time Shen Yun felt such fear.

However, since he was a quick-witted businessman, Shen Yun finally
calmed down.

Shen Yun pointed at Shen Tian and said, “Find someone to kill Zhao Gang

right now! We can’t let him implicate us!”

“Dad, Zhao Gang is very reliable. He won’t tell anyone about us,” Shen
Tian muttered.

“F * ck you!” Shen Yun was so angry that he almost fainted.

“Only dead people can keep a secret. Once he betrays us, the Yan family

will never let us off the hook! Even if they have no evidence!” Shen Yun
said coldly.

“Do it now! Do it now! After that, you and I will return to the provincial

capital overnight!” Shen Yun said coldly.

Shen Tian had no choice but to nod.

…



On the other side, Qin Yu had already arrived at the Yan family’s manor.

In the huge Yan family’s manor, there was only the secretary alone.

The moment Qin Yu entered, the secretary said angrily, “It’s all because
of you! It’s because Miss Yan was worried about your safety that she sent

all her bodyguards to your side! You b*stard, you’ll drag Miss Yan to her

death sooner or later!”

Qin Yu was stunned. He stared blankly at the secretary and said in a

trembling voice, “You… are you telling the truth?”

“Of course!” The secretary said coldly.

“Let me tell you, I have already informed my master about this matter.”

“If anything happens to Miss Yan, just wait for your death!” The secretary
said coldly.

Qin Yu’s expression was extremely ugly. He never thought that Yan
Ruoxue would send all her bodyguards to his side!

Most importantly, Qin Yu didn’t even notice it!

Qin Yu was filled with mixed feelings. He wished he could give himself
a slap.

But now wasn’t the time to let his imagination run wild. The most
important thing was to find Yan Ruoxue’s location as soon as possible and
ensure her safety.

“Take me to Miss Yan’s room immediately.” Qin Yu looked at the

secretary and said anxiously.

The secretary said coldly, “What do you want to do?”



“I have a way to find her! Take me to her quickly!” Qin Yu almost roared
out these words.

The secretary gritted his teeth and said coldly, “Follow me.”

The two of them came all the way to Yan Ruoxue’s room.

As soon as they entered the door, Qin Yu searched around Yan Ruoxue’s
bed.

“What are you doing?” The secretary frowned and asked.

“Why is there no hair?” Qin Yu asked anxiously.

The secretary sneered, “Miss Yan’s room is cleaned every day. How can

there be hair?”

Qin Yu immediately panicked. He grabbed the secretary’s arm and said

anxiously, “Quick, go and find a strand of Miss Yan’s hair for me

immediately. Quick!”

Seeing Qin Yu’s anxious look, the secretary didn’t dare to ask further.

“Wait here.” The secretary snorted.

Qin Yu kept walking around the room while sweating profusely.

Anger and guilt overcame Qin Yu and made him even more anxious.

Finally, the secretary came in with a few strands of hair.

“Qin Yu, what are you trying to do?” The secretary said with a cold

expression.

Qin Yu didn’t answer the question, but asked, “Are you sure this is Miss

Yan’s hair?”



“Obviously,” the secretary said impatiently.

Qin Yu nodded. He waved his hand and said, “You can go out first.”

“What on earth do you want to do?!” The secretary was getting

increasingly puzzled by Qin Yu’s behavior.

“Get out!” Qin Yu immediately shouted!

The secretary gritted his teeth. Although he was angry, he didn’t lose his
temper.

After the secretary went out, Qin Yu reached out and pinched a strand of

hair.

He took a deep breath and bit his finger before throwing a drop of blood
into the air.

At the same time, a dark red light slowly lit up on his finger.

The light quickly wrapped around the strand of hair and floated into the
air to merge with the drop of blood.

This was a forbidden technique left behind by his father. It was
extremely harmful to the body and might even affect his future
advancement path.

However, Qin Yu couldn’t care less now. As long as he could find Yan

Ruoxue, Qin Yu was willing to do anything.

The air was filled with the smell of blood. The scarlet light was like a
lamp, lighting up the entire room!

“Phew!”



Qin Yu spat out a mouthful of blood. His forehead was also covered in

layers of sweat.

A few minutes later, Qin Yu’s eyes suddenly opened.

The light in the room also quickly disappeared.

Everything returned to calm.

Qin Yu stood up with a murderous look in his eyes.

Then, he turned his head and walked out of the room.

At this time, the secretary was waiting outside the door. When he saw

Qin Yu, the secretary asked, “Where are you going?”

Qin Yu glanced at him and said coldly, “I found Miss Yan’s location. I
will bring Miss Yan back safely.”

“You found her?” The secretary was stunned.

He wanted to ask more questions, but Qin Yu had already walked out

quickly and left the Yan family manor in his car..

Chapter 84: You Guys Deserve to Die!

An extremely remote hill.

This place was sparsely populated and was surrounded by dense forests.

Here in this godforsaken place, there wasn’t even a cell phone signal.

In a certain cave, two burly men with tattoos were guarding a beautiful

woman.

“Boss, this girl is really pretty,” one of the big men said with a lecherous

look.



The other burly man also swallowed hard. They had never seen such a

beautiful woman in their entire lives.

“Boss, why don’t we have some fun first?” One of the burly men asked.

The other man frowned and waved his hand. “Forget it. The client said
that we must not hurt her.”

The person tied to the chair was Yan Ruoxue.

At this moment, there was no trace of panic on her face. She was
extremely calm, which made the burly men a little unhappy.

“Do you know the consequences of kidnapping me?” Yan Ruoxue looked
at the two men and said indifferently.

“Hehe, what consequences can there be? I will leave after I get the

money!” One of them said with a smile.

A nonchalant smile appeared on Yan Ruoxue’s face.

“Boss, are we going to stay here for two days?” One of them frowned and

said.

“We can earn 20 million in two days. Where else can we earn so much

money? Don’t be insatiable.” The other person waved his hand and said.

Time passed minute by minute. Qin Yu was rushing here frantically.

The cars on the road kept backing up, but Qin Yu’s panic didn’t subside
in the slightest.

If anything happened to Yan Ruoxue, Qin Yu would be miserable for the

rest of his life.

Finally, half an hour later, the car stopped at the foot of the mountain.



Qin Yu, his fists unconsciously clenched, raised his head to look at the

small mountain.

A murderous aura emanated from him. Anyone who saw it would

tremble.

In the cave, the two burly men kept sizing up Yan Ruoxue.

Looking at Yan Ruoxue’s smooth skin, the two men kept swallowing

hard.

“There’s such a beautiful woman right in front of us, but we can’t touch
her. What a pity!” One of them said.

The eyes of the other brawny man kept darting around. No one knew
what he was thinking.

“F * ck, it doesn’t matter!We’re going to run away sooner or later anyway.
If we sleep with her and go abroad directly, who can find us?” They
finally couldn’t hold it in anymore!

On the second day, they stood up and walked towards Yan Ruoxue.

Yan Ruoxue’s expression became a bit cold.

Facing such desperados, Yan Ruoxue couldn’t do anything either.

“You’d better think about it carefully,” Yan Ruoxue warned coldly.

“We’ve thought about it for a long time now,” the two brawny men said

with a smile.

“To be able to play with a beautiful woman like you for two days, even if
we can’t get the money, we’ll still be satisfied!”

They stretched out their hands and approached Yan Ruoxue step by step.



When they saw that they were getting closer and closer to her, the
breathing of the two of them became rapid.

Just as they were about to touch Yan Ruoxue, a stone suddenly flew in

like a bullet!

This stone happened to hit one of the men’s hands!

In an instant, the palm was pierced through and white bones were

exposed. A bloody smell immediately emanated!

“You… are courting death!” Qin Yu gave off a murderous aura that could

even be felt by Yan Ruoxue, who was a distance away!

Yan Ruoxue looked at Qin Yu in shock. She knew that someone would

definitely come to save her, but she didn’t expect that the first person to
be found would be Qin Yu!

“Miss Yan, are you alright?” Qin Yu looked at Yan Ruoxue and asked

anxiously.

Yan Ruoxue smiled and said, “If you had come a little later, something

might have really happened.”

“D*mn, where did this b*stard come from? How dare he ruin our fun!”
The brawny man covered his hands and said in pain.

“You want to save the damsel in distress? Then I will screw this woman

in front of you!” Another brawny man sneered.

When he heard this, Qin Yu’s anger instantly reached its peak!

In Qin Yu’s heart, Yan Ruoxue was a noble and inviolable woman! Even
Qin Yu himself didn’t dare to have any lewd thoughts!



Yet these two men actually dared to have such improper desires towards
Yan Ruoxue!

“You… are courting death!” Qin Yu clenched his fists tightly. The
murderous aura on his body became increasingly stronger, and a sense of
oppression emanated!

The expressions of the two brawny men changed. For some reason, they
actually felt a sense of fear!

“D*mn it, hurry up and kill this kid!” One of them shouted loudly.

As soon as he finished speaking, the two men charged towards Qin Yu!

Qin Yu’s patience had long since disappeared. He took a step forward and
raised his foot to smash his kneecap into pieces!

“Ouch! !” A painful wail resounded throughout the valley!

Qin Yu didn’t stop there. He reached out and grabbed the necks of the

two burly men to lift them into the air!

“Tell me, who told you to do this?” Qin Yu suppressed his killing intent

and said coldly.

The two burly men struggled desperately in the air, but they found that

they couldn’t break free!

The fear in their hearts reached its peak in an instant!

“Don’t… Don’t kill us…” they spat out these words with great difficulty.

“Say it quickly!” Qin Yu roared angrily, scaring the two men so much

that they instantly wet their pants!



“It’s… It’s Zhao Gang. Someone called Zhao Gang asked us to do this!”
The two brawny men didn’t dare to hide anything and immediately
spilled the beans on Zhao Gang.

When he heard this name, Qin Yu’s expression became even colder.

“Zhao Gang… I didn’t kill you, but you actually dared to plot against

me… and even made a move against Miss Yan…” Qin Yu’s body
trembled due to his anger.

“D*mn it… d*mn it… I shouldn’t have been soft-hearted. I should have

killed him earlier…” Qin Yu guiltily muttered in a low voice.

If he had killed Zhao Gang earlier, Miss Yan wouldn’t have suffered this

kind of misery!

“Sir… We have already told you, so can you spare us…” the two burly

men said in anguish.

Qin Yu looked at the two of them coldly and said, “Anyone who dares to
touch Yan Ruoxue will die!”

After saying that, Qin Yu exerted force with his hand and directly broke

the necks of the two men!

Two burly men instantly fell to the ground and blood stained the ground..

Chapter 85: Reckoning!

After he killed these two people, Qin Yu’s anger didn’t dissipate at all.

He quickly walked in front of Yan Ruoxue and stretched out his hand to
break the rope on Yan Ruoxue’s body.

Yan Ruoxue’s face was somewhat pale. It wasn’t because she was
kidnapped, but because of the two corpses.



Only then did Qin Yu remember that he should not have killed people in
front of Yan Ruoxue.

But at that time, he had already been blinded by anger, so how could he

have thought of it?

“Are you okay?” Qin Yu blocked Yan Ruoxue’s view to prevent her

seeing the corpses.

Yan Ruoxue shook her head and said, “I’m fine.”

“That’s good. Let’s go home.” Qin Yu bent down, then carried Yan

Ruoxue in his arms and walked down the mountain.

Lying in Qin Yu’s arms, Yan Ruoxue felt extremely safe.

She looked up at Qin Yu’s face and couldn’t help but smile.

This kind of warm feeling made Yan Ruoxue, a tough and haughty

woman, feel demure.

They walked all the way down the mountain. Qin Yu carried Yan Ruoxue
into the car and then rushed to the Yan family’s manor.

“Miss Yan, this is all my fault. I promise that it won’t happen again,” Qin
Yu said in a deep voice as he drove.

Yan Ruoxue smiled and said, “This wasn’t your fault to begin with. If you
want to blame someone, blame them for being too bold.”

Qin Yu sighed. He didn’t know what to say.

“Miss Yan, tell your bodyguards to go back. I don’t need protection,” Qin
Yu said with a slight sigh.

Hearing this, Yan Ruoxue couldn’t help but feel a little surprised.



“What a blabbermouth.” Then, Yan Ruoxue couldn’t help but mutter in a

low voice.

The car arrived at the Yan family’s manor soon after.

At this time, the top bigwigs of Jiangcheng had gathered in the Yan

family’s manor.

They looked anxious and had mixed feelings.

If something happened to Yan Ruoxue in Jiangcheng, it would be

troublesome to deal with!

“Miss Yan is back!” At this moment, someone shouted and everyone

rushed towards Yan Ruoxue.

“Miss Yan, are you alright? You scared us to death!”

“I promise to investigate Jiangcheng’s safety issues immediately!”

“I will send someone to protect Miss Yan 24/7 later!”

Everyone spoke one after another with lingering fear.

Yan Ruoxue waved her hand and said, “You guys can go back. I’m a little

tired and want to rest.”

“This…” everyone looked at each other without knowing what to do.

“Miss Yan asked you guys to leave, so you guys can go.” The secretary
waved his hand and said.

Hearing this, everyone left one after another.

After they all left, the secretary looked at Qin Yu and snorted lightly.
“Fortunately, Miss Yan is fine.”



Qin Yu ignored him. He looked at Yan Ruoxue and said, “Miss Yan, you
should rest early. I won’t disturb you.”

“Where are you going?” Yan Ruoxue called out to Qin Yu.

Qin Yu’s back was facing Yan Ruoxue. He took a deep breath and said,
“Nowhere. I should go home and rest.”

After saying this, Qin Yu walked out of the Yan family’s manor quickly.

“Hmph, what a rascal. He’s going to go home and rest just like that? How
rude.” The secretary couldn’t help but snort.

Yan Ruoxue glanced at him and said, “Do you really think he wants to go
home?”

The secretary was stunned and quickly asked, “Miss Yan, what do you
mean by that?”

Yan Ruoxue didn’t answer, but sighed slightly and said, “Call the
higher-ups to ensure Qin Yu’s safety and get someone to clean up the

aftermath.”

The secretary hesitated for a moment and quickly reacted.

Qin Yu wasn’t going home at all. He was going to find the culprit!

“Miss Yan, I might not need to summon anyone.” The secretary shook his
head.

“I have already told theMaster, who was furious when he heard the news
and has already informed all personnel in the Chuzhou region. They sent
a special forces team to Jiangcheng.”

Hearing this, Yan Ruoxue couldn’t help but frown.



“Shut up!” Yan Ruoxue shouted in a cold voice.

The secretary didn’t dare to make a sound.

Yan Ruoxue couldn’t help but rub her smooth forehead in fustration.

“Miss Yan, who is the culprit behind this?” A moment later, the secretary
walked forward and asked tentatively.

Yan Ruoxue didn’t answer this question, but she already had the answer

in mind.

It was definitely not Zhao Gang, who the gangsters mentioned, but
someone else.

…

At this moment, Qin Yu was rushing towards the Zhao family.

The Zhao family lived in Dragon Paradise, the same neighborhood as Qin

Yu did.

At this moment, Zhao Gang was pacing back and forth in his room.

“Honey, what exactly happened? Why do I have a bad premonition?” Su
Yan said with a frown.

Zhao Gang didn’t say anything, but he was terrified.

He called the two gangsters twice, but they couldn’t get through.

“Please don’t let anything happen,” Zhao Gang murmured in a trembling

voice.

At this moment, figure suddenly flashed through the door.

Zhao Gang, who was already nervous, jumped up in alarm.



“Who is it?! Who’s outside?!” Zhao Gang shouted.

It was silent outside the door.

“Honey, who’s there? Aren’t you a little too paranoid?” Su Yan muttered.

Zhao Gang wiped the sweat from his forehead and said in a low voice, “I
hope so…”

“Kacha!”

At this moment, the door of the room was violently smashed open!

Then, a man stepped in!

Chapter 86: Her Father Arrives!

The man’s expression was cold and fierce. It was obvious that he wasn’t
someone to be trifled with.

“Who… who are you?!” Zhao Gang suppressed his fear and said in a

trembling voice.

The man didn’t speak. He only said coldly, “Someone paid for a hit on

your life. Don’t worry, I will let you go more comfortably.”

After saying that, the man walked towards Zhao Gang.

Zhao Gang said in fear, “Don’t come over! Otherwise, I won’t let you off
the hook!”

The man didn’t say anything. He raised his hand and grabbed Zhao Gang.

His fingers were like sharp blades. Whoever he caught was dead meat!

“Bang!”



At this moment, the door was opened again.

The man stopped.

“Qin Yu, you… you came at the right time. Save us quickly!” Zhao Gang
took this opportunity and hurriedly ran to the side.

Qin Yu ignored him. He glared at Zhao Gang and said, “Zhao Gang, I
hadn’t planned to settle the score with you, but how dare you try to plot

against Miss Yan… I must kill you today. I must kill you!”

Zhao Gang’s face instantly turned pale!

He had been exposed? Qin Yu actually knew?

“You… what nonsense are you talking about? I have no idea what you’re

talking about!” Zhao Gang braced himself and said.

Qin Yu gritted his teeth and said, “I won’t give you any chance to

explain.”

“Who are you?” At this moment, the assassin suddenly asked in a cold

voice.

Qin Yu glanced at him and said coldly, “Get lost!”

“How insolent!” The assassin berated.

Qin Yu frowned slightly. He looked at the assassin and said, “Do you
want to die too?”

“That depends on whether you have the ability or not!” The assassin
shouted angrily and grabbed at Qin Yu.

Qin Yu didn’t have the mood to tangle with him. He immediately

clenched his fist and punched him!



This punch almost used up all of Qin Yu’s strength and instantly broke the
assassin’s fist!

Following that, Qin Yu punched through the assassin’s chest!

The assassin, his eyes filled with disbelief, stared blankly at the bloody

hole in front of his chest.

The bloody scene made Su Yan scream!

“Shut up!” Qin Yu was furious. He kicked a stool at Su Yan!

The stool just happened to hit Su Yan’s mouth!

After dealing with this assassin, Qin Yu walked towards Zhao Gang step

by step.

He looked at Zhao Gang coldly and said, “Have you considered the

consequences of this? I was kind enough to spare you, but you actually

dared to plot against Miss Yan… you are simply unforgivable!”

At this moment, Zhao Gang was already scared to death. His entire body
was trembling non-stop, and he couldn’t even stand up.

“Qin Yu, please spare me. It was… it was Shen Tian who asked me to do

this. It has nothing to do with me. It has nothing to do with me… !” Zhao
Gang knelt on the ground with a plop and kept kowtowing.

Qin Yu’s expression turned cold.

It was actually Shen Tian who instigated it!

Originally, Qin Yu had already planned to let the Shen family go. He
didn’t expect Shen Tian to actually do such a thing!



“I will never be soft-hearted to anyone in my life ever again.” Qin Yu’s
heart grew even colder at this moment.

Looking at Zhao Gang, who was miserably begging him on the ground,
Qin Yu didn’t have the slightest bit of pity.

He raised his foot and stomped on Zhao Gang’s head.

Zhao Gang’s head suffered such a huge force that it instantly exploded,
like a watermelon!

Su Yan was so scared that she almost fainted. She ignored the pain of her
mouth and knelt on the ground to beg for mercy, “Qin Yu, for the sake of
us being husband and wife for so many years, please spare my life. I
didn’t know about this at all. I swear…”

Looking at Su Yan, Qin Yu no longer had any patience.

He would rather kill a thousand innocent people than let one guilty person
go!

Just as Qin Yu was about to make his move, his phone suddenly rang.

He picked up the phone and saw that the caller was Yan Ruoxue.

Qin Yu glanced at Su Yan, then walked to the side with the phone.

“Miss Yan, what’s wrong?” Qin Yu asked over the phone.

Yan Ruoxue said, “Where are you now?”

Qin Yu lied, “I’m… I’m at home.”

“I’m at the gate of Dragon Paradise Villa. Accompany me to the

provincial capital,” Yan Ruoxue said in a sullen tone of voice.



Qin Yu was silent for a moment and said, “Okay.”

After hanging up the phone, Qin Yu looked at Su Yan.

“Su Yan, from today onwards, you and I have nothing to do with each

other. Of course, I also warn you that you’d better not tell a soul about

this,” Qin Yu said coldly.

After saying this, Qin Yu quickly rushed to the door.

At the door, a Maybach was waiting.

After Qin Yu got into the car, the car quickly sped off into the darkness.

“You killed Zhao Gang?” Yan Ruoxue asked.

Qin Yu knew that he couldn’t hide it, so he nodded.

Yan Ruoxue didn’t say anything more about this.

“Oh right, this was plotted by Shen Tian!” At this time, Qin Yu seemed

to have thought of something and quickly said.

Before Yan Ruoxue could say anything, the secretary snorted lightly. “Do
you think Miss Yan doesn’t know? Otherwise, why would we go to the

provincial capital?”

Qin Yu opened his mouth and couldn’t help but smile bitterly.

At this moment, at the Shen family in the provincial capital.

Shen Yun’s family was filled with unease, and everyone had a look of

fear on their faces.

“It’s all your fault, you b*stard!” Shen Yun slapped Shen Tian’s face

again.



Shen Tian covered his face and muttered, “Dad, things really aren’t as
serious as you think… There’s no way the Yan family would know that
we did it…”

“F * ck you! You idiot!” Shen Yun’s face was filled with disappointment.

If he had known earlier, he wouldn’t have indulged in Shen Tian like

this!

At this moment, a car suddenly stopped outside the door.

The moment the car stopped, they saw a tall middle-aged man get out of

the car.

He was tall and had an air of grace. His footsteps were sonorous and
beside him, there were two bodyguards.

When he saw this man, Shen Yun’s expression instantly turned extremely

ugly! Even his body started to tremble!

“Yan… Yan Yongxiu! Why… why is he here…” Shen Yun was already

shaking like a leaf!

It was because this man was none other than Yan Ruoxue’s father, the son
of Old Mister Yan!

Chapter 87: The Arrogant Shen Tian

The arrival of Yan Yongxiu unnerved Shen Yun.

This was enough to show that it was almost impossible for this matter to
be settled.

“Shen Tian, remember later. No matter what he says, you must not admit

that this matter has anything to do with you, understand?!” Shen Yun
shouted anxiously.



Shen Tian was still unfazed. He just nodded and said, “I understand.”

Shen Yun was extremely uneasy. In the face of a person like Yan Yongxiu,
none of his achievements and status were worth mentioning!

Very soon, Yan Yongxiu brought people to push the door open and

entered.

Yan Yongxiu’s expression was calm and indifferent.

However, his intimidating aura made people tremble!

Even Shen Tian, who was extremely audacious, was a little afraid at this

moment.

Because Yan Yongxiu’s presence was too imposing! Even the governor
wasn’t as intimidating as him!

“Mr. … Mr. Yan, why are you here…” Shen Yun suppressed the fear

inside and said with a sheepish smile.

Yan Yongxiu glanced at him indifferently and didn’t say anything.

The bodyguard beside him immediately moved a chair and placed it
behind Yan Yongxiu.

Yan Yongxiu slowly sat down and the person beside him lit a cigar for
him.

The room was silent, but the more it was like this, the more frightened
Shen Yun was.

Facing such a person was simply a kind of psychological torture! It was
unbearable!



More and more sweat appeared on Shen Yun’s forehead. His body
swayed and he almost fell to the ground.

Yan Yongxiu slowly exhaled a ring of smoke. He looked at Shen Yun and
said indifferently, “Shen Yun, you have quite some guts.”

When he heard this, Shen Yun’s body softened and he immediately fell

to the ground!

“Mr. … Mr. Yan, I don’t understand your words…” Shen Yun braced

himself and said.

“Oh really?” Yan Yongxiu raised his eyebrows. He took a puff of his
cigar and said with a smile, “Do you think it’s meaningful to lie in front of

me?”

Shen Yun’s body quivered again. He raised his head and said in a

trembling voice, “Mr. … Mr. Yan, I really don’t understand…”

“I don’t understand…” Yan Yunheng’s expression gradually turned cold.

“Then I’ll remind you.”

“The last person who plotted against my daughter was the Sun family.
You should know about the fate of the Sun family very clearly.”

When he heard these words, Shen Yun’s expression changed drastically

again!

The Sun family of Jingdu! Back then, they were also a top-class
blue-blood family in Jingdu!

However, the Sun family, which was prominent at that time, went
bankrupt within a few days! Rumor had it that the Sun family’s elders

and children had gone missing!



That incident was sensational in Jingdu back then, but no one knew
exactly what had happened!

Some people said that the Sun family’s management wasn’t good, and
some said that the Sun family had provoked someone they shouldn’t
have provoked…

But no one knew that this was actually done by the Yan family!

Shen Yun knelt on the ground with a plop. His head hung on the ground,
and he didn’t even dare to raise his head to look at Yan Yongxiu!

“Mr. … Mr. Yan, this incident has absolutely nothing to do with the Shen
family!” Shen Yun clenched his teeth tightly!

He knew very well inside that he couldn’t admit it no matter what!
Because once he admitted it, the Yan family would never let them off the

hook!

Yan Yongxiu looked down at Shen Yun and said coldly, “Raise your head
and look at me.”

Shen Yun’s body stiffened and he said in a trembling voice, “I… I don’t

dare…”

“I told you to raise your head!” Yan Yongxiu immediately shouted!

This bellow scared Shen Yun so much that he fell to the ground.

He struggled to get up from the ground and braced himself to look at Yan
Yongxiu.

As he looked at Yan Yongxiu’s icy countenance, Shen Yun trembled like
a sieve!



Yan Yongxiu looked at Shen Yun coldly and said, “Do you think I need

evidence if I want to get rid of you?”

Shen Yun was stunned and immediately sat down on the ground.

Yes, the Yan family didn’t need evidence at all.

Once they were suspected by the Yan family, there was almost no chance
of survival!

Yan Yongxiu glanced at Shen Tian, who wasn’t far away, and asked

indifferently, “This is your son?”

Shen Yun hurriedly replied, “Yes, yes, Mr. Yan. This is my son, Shen
Tian…”

After saying that, Shen Yun turned his head and shouted, “Greet him!”

Although Shen Tian could feel the powerful aura emanating from Yan
Yongxiu, he, who had been spoiled, still didn’t feel fear.

He snorted and said, “My father has already said that this matter has

nothing to do with us. Why are you so unreasonable?”

When he heard these words, Shen Yun was so angry that he almost
fainted!

“What are you saying, you b*stard?! Apologize to Mr. Yan!” Shen Yun
hurriedly shouted!

Shen Tian still said recklessly, “Even if you are a prominent family in

Jingdu, you still need evidence. What right do you have to say that it has

something to do with us?”

Looking at the stubborn Shen Tian, Yan Yongxiu couldn’t help but laugh.



“Interesting.” Yan Yongxiu rubbed the chair, and the corner of his mouth
curled into a cold smile.

“How impudent! How dare you talk to Mr. Yan like this, are you courting
death!” The bodyguard beside Yan Yongxiu roared angrily.

Shen Tian snorted coldly. “This is Chuzhou, not Jingdu! Moreover, there
are only two of you. As long as I make a call, I guarantee that you won’t

be able to leave Chuzhou. you don’t believe me?!”

Shen Yun was so angered by Shen Tian’s ignorance and arrogance that he
almost collapsed.

At this moment, Yan Yongxiu’s expression had already gradually turned

cold.

“It’s over. It’s over…” Shen Yun knew that this matter probably had no

room for reconciliation.

He slumped to the ground with a vacant look in his eyes.

Shen Tian continued to look at Yan Yongxiu arrogantly while snorting
coldly and said, “You have already made me unhappy. A strong dragon

can’t suppress a local snake. Today, I will punish all of you!”

Yan Yongxiu looked at Shen Tian coldly without saying a word.

Shen Tian took out his phone and quickly dialed a number.

After making the call, Shen Tian sneered and said, “Get lost now. It’s not
too late. Otherwise, I’ll make sure you won’t see the sun tomorrow!”

“Is that so?” Yan Yongxiu smiled nonchalantly.

“It’s been many years since someone dared to talk to me like that.” Yan
Yongxiu raised his head and said with a sigh.



Shen Tian snorted lightly and said, “I’ve already given you a chance. It’s
you who didn’t cherish it. Don’t blame me!”

“Mr. Yan, they’re already here.” At this moment, the bodyguard beside

Yan Yongxiu said.

As soon as he finished speaking, the sound of helicopters suddenly came

from outside the door!

Countless lasers passed through the window and directly shone into the
house!

In addition, there were dozens of armored vehicles and hundreds of fully

armed soldiers outside!

Chapter 88: The Power of the Yan Family

When he saw this scene, Shen Tian’s expression changed drastically!

This… What the h*ll was this situation? Why were the people from the

Chuzhou region here?

“People inside, listen up. You are surrounded! Put down your weapons!”
A loud shout came from outside!

Surrounded? Put down your weapons?

What did this mean?

Shen Tian was dumbfounded. Why did it seem like they were going to

kidnap him?

At this moment, Yan Yongxiu looked at Shen Yun and said indifferently,
“Shen Yun, didn’t you want evidence? I’ll give you one now.”



“You kidnapped a Jingdu merchant and threatened him. Your crime is

unforgivable,” Yan Yongxiu said coldly.

The Shen family’s father and son instantly understood!

Since they couldn’t find evidence of Yan Ruoxue’s kidnapping, then they
would create another crime of kidnapping!

No one would be able to clear themselves of the accusation!

“You… you’re falsely incriminating me!” Shen Tian said anxiously.

“Falsely incriminating? Do you think they will believe me or you?” Yan
Yongxiu said indifferently.

Shen Tian immediately became impatient, but he couldn’t think of any
way to deal with it!

Shen Yun breathed a sigh of relief. It was better to be in prison than to be
killed.

“Thank you for showing mercy, Mr. Yan…” Shen Yun knelt on the

ground and kowtowed desperately.

“Shen Yun,” Yan Yongxiu called out coldly.

Shen Yun hurriedly raised his head and looked at Yan Yongxiu.

“I’m giving you a chance now,” Yan Yongxiu said indifferently.

“As long as you admit to the kidnapping, I can spare your son,” Yan
Yongxiu pointed at Shen Tian and said.

Hearing this, Shen Yun hurriedly shook his head and said, “Mr. Yan, I
really don’t understand what you’re saying…”



After saying that, Shen Yun even hurriedly gave Shen Tian a look.

Unfortunately, not only did Shen Tian ignore Shen Yun, but he even ran to
Yan Yongxiu and said anxiously, “Yes, this matter was done by my father!
It has nothing to do with me!”

Hearing Shen Tian’s words, Shen Yun was stunned on the spot.

“You… what nonsense are you spouting!” Shen Yun shouted angrily.

Shen Tian said in a panic, “Dad, admit it quickly. I’m still young. I don’t
want to go to jail…”

“Mr. Yan said that as long as you admit it, he’ll let me go. Admit it

quickly! You’re already so old. Even if you die, there’s no pity. I’m still

young…”

Shen Yun could barely believe that these words came from his own son’s
mouth!

At this moment, Shen Yun suddenly felt extremely regretful. He
regretted indulging Shen Tian too much…

“What goes around comes around,” Yan Yongxiu said nonchalantly.

Shen Yun’s face was already covered in tears. He raised his head to look

at Yan Yongxiu and said in anguish, “Mr. Yan, this matter… was done by

me. It has nothing to do with my son. Please… please let him go…”

“Mr. Yan, you heard it. My father has already admitted it. Can I leave
now?” Shen Yun said anxiously.

Yan Yongxiu looked at Shen Tian coldly and shook his head. “Kidnapping
my daughter is an unforgivable crime.”



After saying this, Yan Yongxiu slowly stood up and turned around to

leave.

Shen Tian immediately panicked. He shouted desperately, “Mr. Yan, you
said you would let me go. You can’t go back on your word!”

Unfortunately, Yan Yongxiu completely ignored him and walked straight

out of the door.

“You lied to me! Yan Yongxiu, you lied to me!” Shen Tian was on the
verge of breaking down as he roared.

“I’ll fight it out with you. I’ll fight it out with you!” Shen Tian roared and
then rushed towards Yan Yongxiu!

“Bang! Bang!”

At this moment, two gunshots suddenly came from outside the window!

The bullets shattered the glass and shot straight towards the Shen family’s
father and son!

A bloody hole instantly appeared on their foreheads.

Following that, they collapsed to the ground dead.

“Reporting to the commander, the two criminals have been successfully

killed!” A loud shout came from outside.

“Alright, return to the team.”

Qin Yu sat in the car and saw this scene clearly.

As he watched the scene in front of him, he couldn’t help but feel a sense
of powerlessness.



Was this the power of the top aristocratic families in Jingdu…

Yan Ruoxue sat in the car silently. She seemed to have foreseen this

outcome long ago.

Qin Yu looked at Yan Yongxiu, who walked out of the Shen family, and
the sense of powerlessness in his heart grew.

It was because… The two bodyguards by Yan Yongxiu’s side were all top
martial artists!

Qin Yu couldn’t even gauge their strength!
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