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A stone stirred up a thousand waves. 

There was an uproar in the conference hall. 

Everyone felt that they had hallucinations. 

Of course, many people think that Levi Garrison is crazy. 

“This guy really dares to say that he wants to go to Wandao City alone?” 

“That is the base camp of the second largest branch of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce. 
How can one person be able to shake the foundation of more than 100 years of 
operation?” 

“I think he belongs to the ignorant and fearless. Compared with the Wandaocheng base 
camp, this coalition is nothing short of a drop in the bucket. Going there to find trouble is 
equivalent to seeking death!” 

Almost all those who said these words were the powerhouses of the Taiyi God Group. 

Even Wei Shuyang and others who had seen Levi Garrison’s strength were scared to 
death. 

“Mr. Ye, are you kidding me?” 

Wei Shuyang asked in a dry voice. 

Levi Garrison asked indifferently, “Do you think I’m joking?” 

“This……” 

Wei Shuyang was at a loss for words, and he could feel Levi Garrison was a little sullen. 

But no matter what, he felt that the interests of the matter should be made clear, even if 
he angered Levi Garrison. 

“Mr. Ye doesn’t know, this Wandao City has been operated by the Zijin Chamber of 
Commerce for more than a hundred years, and the surrounding sectarian forces are 
intricately complicated, which is tantamount to Longtan Tiger’s Den.” 



“Even those sects that killed the Xingyue Divine Sect before are less than one-tenth of 
the power left behind in Wandao City.” 

“The key is that Wandao City still has an ancient defensive formation that was left over 
from hundreds of years ago, and was later improved and strengthened by countless 
powerhouses of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce.” 

“The Sea of Stars is also heavily organized. The Sea of Stars has set up numerous 
defense and attack formations there, using the power of the water element of the Sea of 
Stars.” 

Wei Shuyang told everything he had learned in one breath, trying to make Levi Garrison 
realize the seriousness of the matter. 

No matter how strong Levi Garrison is, Wandao City is the second branch of the Zijin 
Chamber of Commerce. 

In addition, the strong people at the headquarters of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce 
will provide support at any time. If you go alone, you will not get any benefits at all, and 
you may even risk your life. 

Of course, Wei Shuyang also knew that Zijin Chamber of Commerce would never let it 
go. 

Once Levi Garrison attacked Wandao City again, it would be equivalent to adding fuel to 
the fire, and it would attract even more frantic revenge from the Zijin Chamber of 
Commerce. 

Even if he can retreat with his powerful strength, he will completely ignite the anger of 
many sects in Wandao City. 

At that time, it will not be as simple as a reward order, but will directly evolve into the 
revenge of many sects, so there is absolutely no room for manoeuvre. 

It’s better to let it go for a while, and the Taiyi Chamber of Commerce will mediate in the 
middle. Even if a certain compensation plan is given, it cannot continue to intensify the 
hatred and contradictions. 

“If I don’t destroy Wandao City, can I guarantee that they won’t take revenge? I can’t 
stay at the Star Moon God Sect all the time.” 

Levi Garrison said in a deep voice. 

Wei Shuyang understood what Levi Garrison meant, and the latter just wanted to have 
no worries at all. 



“Mr. Ye, why don’t you wait a few more days, the people from the Taiyi Chamber of 
Commerce headquarters will arrive soon.” 

“We finally agreed on a plan that everyone is satisfied with, what do you think?” 

Wei Shuyang asked tentatively. 

Levi Garrison pondered for a moment, nodded and said, “Okay, but if there is no reason 
to discuss it, I still have to destroy Wandao City.” 

Wei Shuyang let out a sigh of relief, he was really worried that Levi Garrison insisted on 
going to Wandao City immediately. 

“By the way, Mr. Ye, what you asked me to investigate before has been confirmed again 
and again. The informer is the new saint of the Sun Moon Divine Fire Palace.” 

“She had been hiding in the temporary camp of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce before, 
and three elders from the headquarters of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce were sitting 
there.” 

Wei Shuyang changed the subject. 

Inside the temporary stronghold of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce outside Longyang 
City. 

Gong Qianqiu was pacing in confusion, and she had also received information about the 
battle outside the helm of the Xingyue Shenzong. 

For example, the gangster killed the King of Xiaoyao with one shot, and one person and 
one beast group destroyed the Hundred Refinements Tianzong. 
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The coalition forces such as Longhu Temple and Tianyuan Jianzong were also almost 
slaughtered by Levi Garrison and others. 

The messages that followed made Gong Qianqiu even more upset. 

“A bunch of trash, the Zijin Chamber of Commerce is just like that!” 

Gong Qianqiu couldn’t help cursing, thinking that through the power of the Zijin 
Chamber of Commerce, the bandits could be killed to eliminate future troubles. 



I never thought that such a powerful coalition would still be defeated. 

“The bandits won’t ask me to settle accounts after Qiuhou?” 

Every time Gong Qianqiu thinks of this, the whole person becomes more irritable. 

She thought about going out to hide, but after hiding, the Sun Moon Divine Fire Palace 
seemed to be even more unsafe. 

Last time, the Sun Moon Divine Fire Hall suffered heavy casualties with a single arrow 
from thousands of miles away. 

After thinking about it, it is still safe to stay in the temporary stronghold of the Zijin 
Chamber of Commerce, especially the three black-robed elders are from the 
headquarters of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce. 

“Even the gangsters have to give them some thin noodles, right?” 

Gong Qianqiu slandered, the Zijin Chamber of Commerce is a superpower after all, and 
those forces sent out before are less than one-tenth of their full strength. 

“With such a profound background, even if you want to come to the bandits, you won’t 
dare to make trouble.” 

However, such an idea has not completely dissipated, and a strong person from the 
Zijin Chamber of Commerce walked over. 

“Gong Qianqiu, Elder Mo Xie asked you to come over.” 

The Zijin Chamber of Commerce’s strong man’s face was calm, as if he had no emotion 
at all. 

Gong Qianqiu didn’t dare to ask more, the three black-robed elders were far more 
powerful than her, and there were many other powerhouses that she couldn’t compare. 

Playing low-key is the way to live. 

Gong Qianqiu followed the strong men of the Zijin Chamber of Commerce to the 
discussion hall, and found that many sectarian strong men had gathered. 

“Elder Mo called Qianqiu any advice?” Gong Qianqiu asked respectfully. 

Mo Xie wanted to inquire about the details of the battle between the gangsters and the 
powerhouses of the Sun Moon Divine Fire Hall, but suddenly felt a powerful aura 
approaching rapidly. 



“Someone is here, everyone is on alert and ready to fight!” 

Mo Xie immediately gave an order. 

Gong Qianqiu’s heart also mentioned her throat instantly. Her first reaction was that the 
gangsters came to the door, and her face was instantly pale as paper. 

The three elders, Mo Xie, Mo Ya, and Mo Cheng, rushed out of the conference hall, 
followed by the others, their swords drawn and bows drawn, and their eyes stared 
outside. 

Boom! 

With a loud noise, a figure fell from the sky. 

Mo Xie recognized it at a glance, and asked in an extremely cold tone, “What are you 
doing here?” 

Before Wei Shuyang intervened, Mo Xie was already full of anger. 

But because he didn’t know the depth of Levi Garrison’s strength, he didn’t rashly tear 
his face. 

Now that Levi Garrison actually took the initiative to kill him, it is simply too deceiving! 

Levi Garrison smiled and said, “I’m here to find someone.” 

“Who are you looking for?” Mo Xie asked, his tone becoming very impatient. 

Levi Garrison released the breath probe, and soon found the breath of Gong Qianqiu, 
pointing directly to Gong Qianqiu who was hiding in the depths of the crowd. 

“I’m looking for her!” Levi Garrison said playfully. 

Mo Xie and the others quickly realized what was going on. After all, the whereabouts of 
the bandits were originally provided by Gong Qianqiu. 

Is this planning to settle accounts after the fall? 

“Gong Qianqiu said your whereabouts are true, but don’t deceive people too much, this 
is our territory after all.” 

Mo Xie snorted coldly and continued, “It depends on the owner to beat the dog!” 

“You are right!” Levi Garrison said seriously. 



Mo Xie thought that Levi Garrison was intimidated by his own strength, so he planned to 
put a few harsh words to find some ground, but was ruthlessly interrupted by Levi 
Garrison. 

“It’s precisely because I look at you, the master, that I should fight!” 

Levi Garrison said with a smile. 

Mo Xie was choked back by the cruel words that had already reached his lips, and he 
felt very uncomfortable for a while. 

“Don’t go too far, this is not a place for you to be wild…” 

 


